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USDA Crop Progress and Condition: Soybeans in Kansas , 2023 NASS
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USDA Crop Progress and Condition: Sorghum in Kansas , 2023 NASS
" Apil ] May | June | Juy | August | Seplember | _Ociober | November | 4
. BO%
I - :
E E] l.':t'.lndﬂ.n:u'l2 ;:;r 20%
2020
+ i — 2021 40%
g 2025
20%
& 2022
5 Condition Type
e @ Excellent
= E B Good
.E 1 o Fair
3 O Poor
0O Very Poor

Progress

N T e T b T ik T Ao | St | Ot | Nowe
[Progress Year(s) |

Source: National Agricultural Statistics Service (NASS), Crop Progress Report




c
7]
(=]
>

Crop Progress and Condition: Cotton in Kansas , 2023
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USDA Crop Progress and Condition: Winter Wheat in Kansas , 2023 NASS
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U.S. Drought Monitor (e T o 14 389
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Drought Impact Types:
r~ Delineates dominant impacts
$ = Short-Term, typically less than
& months (e.g. agriculiure, grasslands)
L = Long-Term, typically greater than
& months (e.g. hydrology, ecology)

Intensity:

[] Mone

[] DO Abnormally Dry
[] D1 Moderate Drought
[ D2 Severe Drought
I D3 Extreme Drought

Author:

Rocky Bilotta < I D04 Exceptional Drought
NCEINOAA
The Drought Monitor focuses on broad-scale conditions.
Local conditions may vary. For more information on the

Drought Manitor, go to hitos:fdroughtmanitor. un eduw/About. aspx.
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Short-Term Composite Drought Indicator (Experimental)
- October 16, 2023
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Long-Term Composite Drought Indicator (Experimental)
October 16, 2023
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United States
Department of
Agriculture

USDA
)

* Numbers represent the percent of each commodity located in moderate or more
intense drought (D1+) and the changes since last week and last year.

Corn
Soybeans
Cotton
Peanuts
Rice
Sunflowers
Barley
Sorghum
Durum Wheat
Spring Wheat
Winter Wheat
Hay
Alfalfa Hay

Agriculture in Drought* 11
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Corn & Sorghum Markets
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USD United States

= " GornYAreaslinlDrought 14
Reflects October 17, 2023
U.S. Drought Monitor data
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. Major Crop Area
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Approximately 50% of corn b .‘ '--,
production is within an area ‘ _ : : b
experiencing drought.




ELEC. CORN (@C2023Z)

Symbol Search | Symbol Lookup

Historical Chart | Chart | Options | Futures Chain | Spread Matrix
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Corn Futures-Managed Money Traders (SP¢°S):  ong & Short Positions

June 2012 through October 10, 2023¢7¢ %4t + Qctober 17, 2023 DEC?%23 Corn Futures ¢oss
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Kansas Cash & Futures Prices

Date

10/20/2023 Early a.m. |

Grain Futures Contracts

Closing §

DEC 2023 Corp 1202 L4¥d Cortact - Ocaober Deivery)

MAR 2024 corn{lﬁw Dec-Feb Post-Harvest Delveres]

$5.0650
$5.1775

10/20/2023 Early a.m.

Cash Grain & Harvest Contract Prices @ Kansas Grain Elevators

Representing the hi j il location
Cash Market Spot & FC Bids Colby***  /’Salina™*®  Topeka™** sarden City *** futchinson ~ YColumbus 3
NW KS NC KS EC-NE KS SW KS SCKS SEKS
Corn Spot Cash$ $5.12 $5.14 $4.87 $5.32 $5.22 $4.87
October Corn Harvest Cash Basis 50.05 50.07 (50.20) 50.26 50.15 (50.20)
Corn Post-Harvest FC$: Fall % $5.08 No Bid $4.97 $5.22 $5.12 $4.72
Dec-Feb Corn Post-Harvest FCS Basis ($0.10) [ #VALUE! {$0.21) 50.04 {$0.06) {50.46)
Grain Sorghum Spot Cash$ $5.32 $5.52 $5.27 $5.22 $5.67 $4.67
October Sorghum Spot Cash Basis $0.26 $0.45 $0.20 $0.15 $0.61 (50.40)
Grain Sorghum Post-Harvest FC$: Fall % $5.32 No Bid No Bid $5.17 $5.37 No Bid
Dec-Feb Sorghum Post-Harvest FCS Basis 50.14 '\ #VALUE! ’ #VALUW (50.01) 50.19 #VALUE!

Pa—
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SALINA, KS: Corn Basis - CARGILL 19
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U.S. Corn Acreage for 2010-2023

Sources: USDA Crop Production & WASDE %/12/2023 Reports
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U.S. Corn Yields for 2014-2023

Through USDA reports on October 12, 2023 + K-State Yield Estimate 10/17/2023/2023
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October 12, 2023
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October 2023 Corn Yield

Bushels and Percent Change from Previous Year

United States
173.0
-0.2

U.S. Corn Supply and Demand

2022/2023 2023/2024
Change from Change from Change from
Item Estimate September 12| Forecast September12 2022/2023
Planted area (million acres) 88.6 " 94.9 - 6.3
Harvested area (million acres) 79.1 0.1 87.1 - 8.0
Yield (bushels per acre) 173.4 i 173.0 -0.8 -0.4
Million bushels -—---——-
Beginning stocks 1,377 - 1,361 -90 -16
Production 13,715 -15 15,064 -69 1,350
Imports 39 -1 25 - -14
Total supply 15,130 -16 16,451 -160 1,320
Feed and residual 5,549 124 5,600 -25 51
Food, seed, and industrial 6,559 -46 6,715 - 156
Ethanol 5,177 -18 5,300 -- 123
Domestic use 12,108 78 12,315 -25 207
Exports 1,661 -4 2,025 -25 364
Total use 13,769 74 14,340 -50 571
Ending stocks 1,361 -90 2,111 -110 749
Percent —
Stocks to use ratio 9.9 -0.7 14.7 -0.7 4.8
-----e-—--- Dollars per bushel ------—---
Average market price 6.54 001 | ass 0.05 -1.59

- No change. ** Rounds to zero.

October 12, 2023

24
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U.S. Ethanol Production & Stocks v
Based on U.S. DOE — EIA on U.S. Ethanol Industry Trends as of October 6, 2023
30,000 [ ] | o] | [or] | (o] | s | e | (o) | [ | o] | [ | ] | o) | (i) ()
E zs,omH 1 |
gzo,mo NS = £ [ : |
ﬁE i ' ' e ' [~6/472010t0 ' }
|
|
N 5

U.S. Corn Use & Ending Stocks

MY 2012/13 thru “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of USDA Reports thru October 12, 2023
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U.S. Corn Stocks & % Stocks-to-Use

MY 2012/13 thru “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the 10/12/2023 USDA + KSU Estimates
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U.S. Corn % Stocks/Use vs Corn S

MY 2012/13 thru “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA #s * 5V Ess. 1017/2023
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U.S. Corn Supply-Demand Balance Sheet

“New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the 10/12/2023 USDA WASDE + KSU Estimates Asof10/19/2023
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U.S. Corn % Stocks/Use vs Corn $

MY 2012/13 thru “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA #s * SV st 10/17/2023
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EmU.S. Corn % Ending Stocks/Use ——U.S. Corn Price

A. USDA #1 B. KSU #2 C. KSU #3 D. KSU #4
“New Crop” MY 2023/24 | “New Crop” MY 2023/24 | "New Crop” MY 2023/24 | “New Crop” MY 2023/24
“Average Yields” “Lower Yields” “Yet Lower Yields” “still Lower Yields"
=173.0 by/ac 172.0by/ac @ 14.981bb | 171.0by/ac @ 14.893bb_| 170.0 bufac @ 14.806 bb_
Item 15.064 bb Corn Crop with No Rationing with No Rationing with No Rationing
% Probability of Occurring (KSU) 60%"5Uest 25%Suest 10%"SVest 59¢KSUest
Planted Area (million acres) 94.868 94.868 94,868 94.868
| Harvested Area imitionacres 87.096 87.096 87.096 81096 |
Yield / harvested acre (by/ac) 173.0 172.0 171.0 170.0
Million Bushals
Production (million bu.) 15,064 -83mb 14,981 -171 mb 14,893 -258mp 14,806
Total Sungk {million bu.) 16,451 -33mp» 16,367 -171 mb 16,279 -258mb 16,192 | J
Total Use mition bu,) 14,340 | 14,340 | 14,340 14,340
Ending Stocks (mitlion bu.) 2,111 -84mb 2,027 -172mb 1,939 -259mb 1,852 h
% Ending Stocks-to-Use 14.72% 14.14% 13.52% 12.91%
$4,95 UsDA $5.15 kU $5,35 KU $5.55 KsU
U.S. Corn Average Farm Price i/vun $5.14 XSU10/15/2023 | g5 14 KSU 10/19/2023 $5.14 K5U10/19/2023 $5.14 KSU10/19/2055 |




“World 'ess-china” Corn Supply-Demand

MY 2007/08 — “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE Report
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South America Corn Supply-Demand

MY 2007/08 — “New Crop” 2023/24, as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE
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China Corn Supply-Demand

MY 2007/08 — “New Crop” MY 2023/24, as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report
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World vs World '¢s5-¢hina Corn % Stocks-to-Use

MY 2007/08 through “Current” MY 2022/23, as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report
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U.S. Corn $ YSP3 Adi- yg World Less-China o S /U

MY 2007/08 — “New Crop” MY 2023/24, as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE

U.S. Corn Price /bu (USD Adj.)

$9
MY 2022/23: 10.63 %S/U,
$7.95 ™0 (56,54 /bu)
$8

MY 2021/22: 11.14 %5/U,
$7 $7.03 ™0 (56.00 /bu)

MY 2012/13:
9.47,% /U MY 2023/24:12.34 %5/U,
$6 $6.34 W0 $6.09 ™0 (54.95 /bu)
(56.89 /bu)

$5

MY 2016/17: 15.94,%5/U,
$3.84 ™0 ($3.36 /bu)

$3 imzm;xn: 13.56,%5/U $3.32 ° (53.55 ,fbull
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Soybean Markets

KANSAS STATE

Department of Agricultural Economics
UNIVERSITY
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USDA,  tmited states

- SoybeanyAreaslinlDrought
L3 e o et e Reflects October 10, 2023
U.S. Drought Monitor data

',/_4 Dvought Area
. Major Crop Area
B minor crop area

Approximately 58% of soybean
production is within an area
experiencing drought.




ELEC. SOYBEANS (@S2023X) ) Print

Symbol Search | Symbol Lookup Historical Chart | Chant | Options | Futures Chain | Spread Matrix

Current Month: | Nov 2023 ~ | prev | next
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Monthly Commodity Futures Price Chart  TFc Commodity Charts
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Soybean Futures-Managed Money Traders (SPe¢s); [ ong & Short Positions

June 2006 through October 10, 2023 ©FT¢bata + October 17, 2023 NOV2023 Soybean Futures

Price ($/bu)

1,200 ..

Trader Positions (Million Bushels)
w
8

M Long Managed Money (Specs) EMShort Managed Money (Specs) —Soybean Futures

Kansas Cash & Futures Prices
Date
10/20/2023 Early a.m. |
Grain Futures Contracts Closing §
NOV 2023 Soybeans 2023 3¢ coract- Oaodes Deives) $13.2675
JAN 2024 Soybeans 202 ¥ov-dsc FostHanvest Defveres) $13.2175
10/20/2023 Early a.m. Cash Grain & Harvest Contract Prices @ Kansas Grain Elevators
Representing the highest bids available at each location
Cash Market Spot & FC Bids Colby™*®  /Salina™**  Topeka** garden City ***(Hutchinson *\columbus **3
NW KS NCKS EC-NEKS SWKS SCKS SEKS
Soybean Spot Cash$ $12.18 $12.72 $12.68 $12.29( $12.93 $12.45
October Soybean Spot Cash Basis ($1.09) ($0.55) (30.59) ($0.98) (0.34) ($0.82)
Soybean Post-Harvest FC$: Fall % $1228(  NoBid No Bid $12.29 No Bid $12.44
Nov-Dec Soybean Post-Harvest FCS Basis ($1.00) \ #VALUE! ' #VALUE!/ (0.99) i #VALUE!} ($0.84)
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SALINA, KS: Soybeans Basis - CARGILL
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HUTCHINSON, KS: Soybeans Basis - MID KANSAS COOP
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.S. Soybean Acreage for 2013-2023

Years 2013-2023 as of the October 12,2023 USDA Reports

Million Acres
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U.S. Soybean Yields: 2010-2023

As of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE & ERS Reports + KSU Estimates
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October 12, 2023 October 2023 Soybean Yield

Bushels and Percent Change from Previous Year

United States
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# = Record High
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U.S. Soybeans Supply and Demand

2022/2023 2023/2024
Change from Change from Change from
Item Estimate  September 12| Forecast September12 2022/2023
Planted area (million acres) 87.5 -- 83.6 -- -3.9
Harvested area (million acres) 86.2 -0.2 82.8 -- -3.4
Yield (bushels per acre) 49.6 e 49.6 -0.5 0.0
weeeeemeeeee Million bushels -----------
Beginning stocks 274 - 268 18 -6
Production 4,270 -6 4,104 -42 -166
Imports 25 -5 30 - 5
Total supply 4,569 -11 4,403 -24 -167
Crush 2,212 -8 2,300 10 88
Seed and Residual 97 -23 128 2 31
Domestic use 2,309 -31 2,428 12 119
Exports 1,992 2 1,755 -35 -237
Total use 4,301 -29 4,183 -23 -118
Ending stocks 268 18 220 s -49
Percent
Stocks to use ratio 6.2 05 | 52 ** 1.0
----———- Dollars per bushel —————
Average market price 14.20 - I 12.90 - -1.30

- No change. ** Rounds to zero.

October 12, 2023
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U.S. Soybean Use & Ending Stocks

MY 2012/13 - Projected “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA Reports
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U.S. Soybean % Stocks/Use vs U.S. $’s

MY 2009/10 — “Next Crop” 2023/24 as of October 12, 2023 USDA Reports
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N %
mmU.S. Soybean % Ending Stocks/Use  —=-U.S. Soybean Price
y . |
U.S. Sovb Proiected S-D “New Crop” MY 2023/24 48
.S. Soybean Projecte
As of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE Report + KSU Scenarios A9/ 10/19/2023
A. USDA WASDE Scenario ¥1 B. KSU Scenario 82 C. KSU Scenario 83 D. KSU Scenario 84
“New Crop” 2023/24 “New Crop” 2023/24 “New Crop” 2023/24 “New Crop” 2023/2a
Using 10/12/2023 USDA Info. Yield: 49.1 bufac Yield: 48.1 bufac Yield: 47.1 bufac
Item Yield: 49.6 bu/acre + USDA Usage #'s + Rationed Usage + Rationed Usage
% Probability of Occurring (KSU) 55941SUest 309%SUest 10%SUest 59/SUest
Planted Area (million acres) 83.600 83.600 83.600 83.600
Harvested Area (million acres) 82.791 82.791 82.791 82.791
( Yield / harvested acre (bu/ac) 49.6 49.1 48.1 47.1 )
Production (million bu.) 4,104 (-39 mb) 8,065 (-122 mb) 3,982 (205 mb) 3,899
L Total Supply (million bu.) 4,403 {40 mb) 4,363 (-123 mb) 4,280 (-206 mb) 4,197 )
( Domestic Crushings 2,300 2,300 (-20mb) 2,280 (40 mb) 2,260 )
Exports 1,755 1,755 (-20mb) 1,735 40 me) 1,715
Residual 27 27 (-3 mb) 24 (-3 mb) 24
Total Use 4,183 4,183 (-43 mb) 4,140 (-83 mb) 8,097
Ending Stocks 220 (40mp) 180 (-80mb) 140 (120 mp) 100
% Ending Stocks-to-Use 5.26% 4.30% 3.38% 2.449%
: $12,905%% $13.75 ™ $14.75 " $15.75 ¢
U U.S. Avg. Farm Price (5/bu) $13.54 55U 10/15/2023 $13.54 /U 10/19/2023 13,54 ¥V 0/15/2023 $13,54 *Sv30/19/2023 )




U.S. Soybean % Stocks/Use vs U.S. CashS$

MY 2009/10 — “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE + KSU Estimates
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mm U.S. Soybean % Ending Stocks/Use  —=-U.S. Soybean Price

- T .
H ____|515.75 $ik o
: 614.75] =
14.20 51374 ¢ L g
3018161290 g 514 »
o e
! $12 o
o
$10
=2
S8

49

World ‘es-¢hina §oybean Use & End Stocks

MY 2008/09 - “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 WASDE
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South America Soybean Supply-Demand

MY 2007/08 — “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE Report 5 1
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World vs “World 'es-<"na” soybean % Stocks/Use 53

MY 2007/08 through “New Crop” MY 2023/24, as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report
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Wheat Markets
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B?s%eo\'ely - l @ Your Price  https://prodwebnlb.rma.usda.gov/apps/PriceDiscovery/GetPrices/YourPrice 55

Commodity: Wheat
State: Kansas
Sales Closing Date: September 30, 2023

Base Contract: KCBT July HRW Wheat 2024 (KEN24)

Projected Price Price Volatility Harvest Price

$7I44 o- 23 Not Yet Available
per Bushel

Status In Discovery ery Yet To Start
Start Date 8/15/2023 an NIA Commodity: Wheat
End Date 9/14/2023 9/14/2023 NIA State: Kansas
Sales Closing Date: September 30, 2022
Base Contract: KCBT July HRW Wheat 2023 (KEN23)
Projected Price Price Volatility Harvest Price
$8.79 0.31 $8.20
per Bushel per Bushel
Status Released Released Released
Start Date B/15/2022 B/15/2022 6/1/2023
End Date 9/14/2022 9/14/2022 6/30/2023

USDA United States

- WinterdWheat#AreaslinlDrought]

Reflects October 17, 2023
U.S. Drought Monitor data

56

¥ Drought Area
. Major Crop Area
I minor crop area

Approximately 48% of winter wheat
production is within an area
experiencing drought.




ELEC. HRW WHEAT

Symbeol Search | Symbol Lookup

(@KW2023Z)

& Print

Historical Chart | Chart | Options | Futures Chain | Spread Matrix
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Current Month: | Dec 2023 ~ | prev | next
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Monthly Commodity Futures Price Chart  trc commodity chants
Wheat (Kansas) (Electronic) «cen

KE - Wheat (Kansas) (Electronic) - Monthly Chart
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Change: 16.250
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Kansas Cash & Futures Prices
Date
10/20/2023 Early a.m, |
Grain Futures Contracts Closing §
DEC 2023 KC HRW Wheat 20 #2 radl $6.8175
JULY 2024 KC HRW Wheat %24 mervesscamsact $6.9800
10/20/2023 Early a.m, Cash Grain & Harvest Contract Prices @ Kansas Grain Elevators
Representing the highest bids available at each location
Cash Market Spot & FC Bids Colboy*®® /Salina*®*  Topeka™*™ Ngarden City “*] Hutchinson ***Yolumbus **
NWKS NCKS EC-NEKS SWKS SCKS SEKS
KC HRW Wheat Harvest Spot Cash$ $6.02 $6.62 $6.57 $6.23 $6.63 $6.23
HRW Wheat Pre-Harvest Spot Cash Basis (0.80 (50.20) ($0.25) (0.59 (30.19) ($0.59)
KC HRW Wheat FC$ - Next Harvest 2*** $6.38 $6.58 $6.68 $6.48 $6.68 $6.42
HRW Wheat 2024 Harvest FCS Basis rso.so\ ($0.40) fSO&ﬂJ) ($0.50A (0.30)) (0.56)

Week 5

SALINA, KS: Hard Red Winter Wheat Basis - CARGILL

www.AgManager.info

Week 10 Week 1 Week 20

& 1 Year Average - 2019 through 2022 o 2023
COLBY, KS: Hard Red Winter Wheat Basis - CORNERSTONE AG

www.AgManager.info

Week 5 Week 10 Week 1 Week 20

& 3 Year Average - 2019 through 1022 § 1023

60




U.S. Wheat Production by Class

As of the USDA NASS September 12, 2023 Crop Production Report & Wheat Yearbook Tables
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|
U.S. Wheat Use & Ending Stocks
MY 2012/13 — “Next Crop” 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA Reports
1,500 - ]
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S Y
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62




U.S. Wheat % Stocks/Use vs Cash S’s

MY 2009/10 thru “New Crop” MY 2023/24 - As of the October 12, 2023 USDA Reports
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“World'=*=hina” \Wheat Usage & Ending Stocks

MY 2007/08 - “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE Report
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*** 16-year low ***
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Ukraine Wheat Supply-Demand

MY 2013/14 - “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report
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L L iﬂ L iz' i]@ ; % ER:;;; Wheat Supply-Demand

6\?’ ‘P'f’\ MY 2013/14 - “New Crop” 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report
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Australia Wheat Supply-Demand Trends

MY 2013/14 = “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report

Million Metric Tons
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' Canada Wheat Supply-Demand Trends

MY 2013/14 — “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report
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L]
European Union Wheat S-D Trends
MY 2013/14 - “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report 67
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Turkey Wheat S-D Trends

MY 2013/14 — “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report
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U.S. Wheat $ 7rade-Wtd UsDS g World Less-china o4 S /U

MY 2008/09 through “New Crop” 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE
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% World'ess-China Ending Stocks-to-Use

World vs “World 'e*<"na” \Wheat Stocks & % S/U

MY 2007/08 through “New Crop” MY 2023/24 as of the October 12, 2023 USDA WASDE report
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Cotton Markets

— Cotton Acres
United States

Million Acres
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United States Department of Agriculture

National Agricultural Statistics Service September 12, 2023




Cotton Yield
United States
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United States Department of Agriculture
National Agricultural Statistics Service October 12, 2023

— October 2023 Cotton Yield

Pounds and Percent Change from Previous Year
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National Agricultural Statistics Service October 12,2023 August 11, 2023
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A,
5

‘Q‘% Cotton Production :

United States

w2

Million Bales
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14.6
15.0 14.5
12.9 12.8
10.0
5.0
0.0
2014 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020

2021 2022 2023

United States Department of Agriculture

National Agricultural Statistics Service October 12, 2023

U.S. Cotton Supply and Demand 76

2022/2023  2023/2024 Change from Change from

Item estimate forecast September12 2022/2023

/ Planted area (million acres) 13.76 10.23 -- -3.53

Harvested area (million acres) 7.31 8.02 -- 0.71

Yield (pounds per acre) 950 767 -19 -183

—--—eem— Million bales -----—-—-

Beginning stocks 4.05 4.25 - 0.20

Production 14.47 12.82 -0.32 -1.65

Imports 0.00 0.01 - bt

\ Total supply 18.52 17.07 -0.31 -1.45 j

Mill use 2.05 2.15 - 0.10

Exports 12.77 12.20 -0.10 -0.57

Total use 14.82 14.35 -0.10 -0.47

Unaccounted -0.55 -0.08 -0.02 0.47

Ending stocks 4.25 2.80 -0.20 -1.45
——————— Percent -

Stocks to use ratio 28.7 19.5 -1.2 -9.2
------—--- Cents per pound —---—--—---

Average market price 84.80 80.00 - -4.80

e ¥
No change. **Rounds to zero. October 12, 2023
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18 Questions?

Daniel O’Brien — Extension Ag Economist
Blog: www.ksugrains.wordpress.com

KSUGrains on Twitter

www.AgManager.info

K ANSAS STATE
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